
The Laboratory «Traceability for Authenticity»
carries out research on traceability and the
protection of fashion products Made-in Italy in
collaboration with local enterprises and other
Universities from the Veneto Region, within the
Project «Traceability, Anti-counterfeiting and
Certification of Fashion Products Made-in
Italy» 2017–2020 promoted by the Regional
Innovative Network FACE Design.

The Fashion LAB, didactic innovative teaching
classes, and The Fashion HUB, a multidisciplinary
research team, have been launched within the
Project «Law, Technologies and Social
Changes» 2018–2022 of the Law Department,
that has been identified as ‘Department of
excellence’ within a national selection promoted
by the Italian Ministry of University and Research.

Jean Monnet Module 2015–2018, co-funded by
the Erasmus+ Programme of the European
Commission. It envisaged a Summer School on
the Fashion Industry in the European Union, a
teaching course on economic and legal aspects
related to the fashion sector.
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